Cornerstone Pavers Lalonde Contractors Milwaukee Gen.Construction Stark Asphalt Payne & Dolan
#2015-05 Eaton/Merrill/Barland Road Reconstruction 6422 WI-31 2929 S. Chase Ave. 4580 S. 13th Street 12845 W. Burleigh Road N3 W23650 Badinger Road
Racine, WI 53402 Milwaukee, W1 53207 Milwaukee, W1 53221 Brookfield, W1 53005 Waukesha, W1 53188
Item # |Description |Est. Quantity| Unit | UnitPrice |  Total Price Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price |  Total Price Unit Price |  Total Price
Base Bid - Concrete

1 Furnish, Install & Maintain Inlet Protection 45 EA $49.00 $2,205.00 $50.00 $2,250.00 $50.00 $2,250.00 $50.00 $2,250.00

2 Furnish Concrete Pavement Removal 18,060 SY $2.74 $49,484.40 $5.15 $93,009.00 $4.06 $73,323.60 $6.10 $110,166.00

3 Furnish Concrete Sidewalk & Driveway Removal 900 Sy $3.20 $2,880.00 $0.48 $432.00 $7.89 $7,101.00 $6.60 $5,940.00

4 Furnish Unclassified Excavation 3,300 cY $9.15 $30,195.00 $16.60 $54,780.00 $18.35 $60,555.00 $22.60 $74,580.00

5 Furnish Excavation Below Subgrade (EBS) 650 cY $19.00 $12,350.00 $16.52 $10,738.00 $16.91 $10,991.50 $22.60 $14,690.00

6 Furnish Sawcut 2,950 LF $1.29 $3,805.50 $1.99 $5,870.50 $1.40 $4,130.00 $1.40 $4,130.00

7 Furnish & Place 1-1/4" Stone Base 6,550 TON $9.90 $64,845.00 $13.33 $87,311.50 $13.41 $87,835.50 $14.20 $93,010.00

8 Furnish & Place 7" Concrete Pavement 4,560 sY $26.70 $121,752.00 $24.08 $109,804.80 $22.82 | $104,059.20 $27.75 $126,540.00

9 Furnish & Place 8" Doweled Concrete Pavement 12,500 Sy $30.33 $379,125.00 $29.24 $365,500.00 $27.83 $347,875.00 $32.60 $407,500.00

10 |Furnish & Place 30" Curb & Gutter 5,250 LF $14.95 $78,487.50 $12.92 $67,830.00 $13.71 $71,977.50 $13.75 $72,187.50

11 |Furnish & Place 30" Curb & Gutter - Hand Poured 775 LF $17.95 $13,911.25 $21.90 $16,972.50 $20.37 $15,786.75 $28.60 $22,165.00

12 Furnish & Place 7" Concrete Driveway Apron 515 5% $36.00 $18,540.00 $42.59 $21,933.85 $52.06 $26,810.90 $41.40 $21,321.00 No Bid
13 |Furnish & Place 7" Concrete Handicap Ramp 1,580 SF $4.00 $6,320.00 $4.71 $7,441.80 $6.07 $9,590.60 $5.70 $9,006.00

14 |Furnish & Place 7" Concrete Sidewalk 260 SF $4.00 $1,040.00 $4.71 $1,224.60 $6.07 $1,578.20 $6.50 $1,690.00

15 |Furnish & Place 5" Concrete Sidewalk 2,450 SF $3.75 $9,187.50 $3.35 $8,207.50 $5.41 $13,254.50 $3.75 $9,187.50

16 |Furnish Tie Bars 2,500 EA $4.83 $12,075.00 $2.65 $6,625.00 $4.66 $11,650.00 $5.50 $13,750.00

17 |Furnish & Install 1/2" Felt 1,250 LF $0.85 $1,062.50 $0.01 $12.50 $0.40 $500.00 $1.55 $1,937.50

18 |Furnish Linseed Oil Cure 250 GAL $15.18 $3,795.00 $0.01 $2.50 $7.75 $1,937.50 $10.00 $2,500.00

19 |Furnish & Place Detectable Warning Fields (24" x 24" Cast DWD Yellow) 48 EA $123.00 $5,904.00 $27.50 $1,320.00 $123.00 $5,904.00 $150.00 $7,200.00

20 |Furnish Traffic Control 1 LS $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,140.00 $8,140.00 $4,853.00 | $4,853.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00

21 |Furnish 8" Top Soil & Sod 5,400 SF $1.80 $9,720.00 $1.75 $9,450.00 $1.75 $9,450.00 $1.85 $9,990.00

22 |Furnish Terrace Restoration 7,650 SF $1.80 $13,770.00 $1.15 $8,797.50 $1.15 $8,797.50 $1.85 $14,152.50

Subtotal (Items 1-22) $848,954.65 $887,653.55 $880,211.25 $1,028,393.00
Sewer/Drainage Items

23 |Furnish & Install 4" ADS Drain Tile w/ Silt Sock (includes 3/8" stone chip backfill) 4,950 LF $5.64 $27,918.00 $13.50 $66,825.00 $14.13 $69,943.50 $15.10 $74,745.00

24 Adjust Structure (6" or less) (Catchbasins) 34 EA $250.00 $8,500.00 $475.00 $16,150.00 $475.00 $16,150.00 $475.00 $16,150.00

25 Repair Structure (6" or Greater) (Includes Catchbasins, Manholes & Sanitary) 10 VF $500.00 $5,000.00 $350.00 $3,500.00 $350.00 $3,500.00 $350.00 $3,500.00

26 Remove Abandoned Structure 3 EA $275.00 $825.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $1,500.00

27 Furnish & Install 84" Deck Slab Storm MH 6 VF $500.00 $3,000.00 $1,300.00 $7,800.00 $1,300.00 $7,800.00 $1,300.00 $7,800.00

28 |Furnish & Install 60" Deck Slab Storm MH 4 VF $420.00 $1,680.00 $700.00 $2,800.00 $700.00 $2,800.00 $700.00 $2,800.00 No Bid
29 Furnish & Install Manhole Frame & Grate (Neenah R-1661-A Frame, Lid w/ Pickhole) 2 $675.00 $1,350.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $1,000.00

30 [Furnish & Install 24" x 36" Storm Catchbasin 60 VF $240.00 $14,400.00 $395.00 $23,700.00 $395.00 | $23,700.00 $395.00 $23,700.00

31 Furnish & Install Catch Basin Frame & Grate - Neenah R-3246 w/ Type C Grate 12 EA $450.00 $5,400.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $500.00 $6,000.00
32 Furnish & Install 12" RCP Storm Sewer Class V (w/ gravel backfill) 170 LF $75.00 $12,750.00 $115.50 $19,635.00 $115.50 $19,635.00 $115.50 $19,635.00
33 Furnish Storm Water Basin Construction 250 Sy $18.00 $4,500.00 $4.00 $1,000.00 $16.70 $4,175.00 $29.50 $7,375.00

Subtotal (Items 23-33) $85,323.00 $149,910.00 $156,203.50 $164,205.00
Concrete Base Bid Totals

1 General Items (Iltems 1 - 22) $848,954.65 $887,653.55 $880,211.25 $1,028,393.00

;) Sewer/Drainage Items (Items 23 - 33) $85,323.00 $149,910.00 $156,203.50 $164,205.00 No Bid
3 Contingency $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

Base Bid Total $959,277.65 $1,062,563.55 $1,061,414.75 $1,217,598.00

Alternate Asphalt Bid 1




1 Furnish, Install & Maintain Inlet Protectioion 45 EA $50.00 $2,250.00 $50.00 $2,250.00 $55.00 $2,475.00
2 Furnish Concrete Pavavement Removal 17,260 Sy $5.15 $88,889.00 $6.10 $105,286.00 $2.00 $34,520.00
3 Furnish Concrete Sidewalk & Driveway Removal 900 Sy $0.48 $432.00 $6.60 $5,940.00 $4.00 $3,600.00
4 Furnish Unclassified Excavation 3,270 CY $16.60 $54,282.00 $22.60 $73,902.00 $28.00 $91,560.00
5 Furnish Excavation Below Subgrade (EBS) 650 cY $16.52 $10,738.00 $22.60 $14,690.00 $28.00 $18,200.00
6 Furnish Sawcut 2,950 LF $1.99 $5,870.50 $1.40 $4,130.00 $1.40 $4,130.00
7 Furnish & Place 1-1/4" Stone Base 7,200 TON $13.33 $95,976.00 $14.20 $102,240.00 $12.56 $90,432.00
8 Furnish & Place 4-1/2" HMA Binder Course Type E-3 (19mm) (Multiple Lifts) 4,250 TON $51.33 $218,152.50 $54.50 $231,625.00 $51.98 $220,915.00
9 Furnish & place 1-1/2" HMA Surface Course Type E-3 (12mm) 1,450 TON $55.70 $80,765.00 $58.80 $85,260.00 $56.42 $81,809.00
10 Furnish & Place Tac Coat 1,600 GAL $2.05 $3,280.00 $2.00 $3,200.00 $2.06 $3,296.00
11 Furnish & Place 7" Concrete Pavement 565 Sy $24.08 $13,605.20 $29.75 $16,808.75 $34.00 $19,210.00
12 Furnish & Place 30" Curb & Gutter 5,250 LF No Bid $12.92 $67,830.00 No Bid $13.75 $72,187.50 $16.50 $86,625.00
13 Furnish & Place 30" Curb & Gutter - Hand Poured 775 LF $21.90 $16,972.50 $28.60 $22,165.00 $29.00 $22,475.00
14 Furnish & Place 7" Concrete Driveway APron 515 SY $42.59 $21,933.85 $41.40 $21,321.00 $32.00 $16,480.00
15 Furnish & Place 7" Concrete Handicap Ramp 1,580 SF $4.71 $7,441.80 $5.70 $9,006.00 $3.90 $6,162.00
16 Furnish & Place 7" Concrete Sidewalk 150 SF $4.71 $706.50 $7.00 $1,050.00 $3.90 $585.00
17 Furnish & Place 5" Concrete Sidewalk 2,450 SF $3.35 $8,207.50 $3.75 $9,187.50 $3.74 $9,163.00
18 Furnish Tie Bars 480 EA $2.65 $1,272.00 $5.50 $2,640.00 $15.00 $7,200.00
19 Furnish & Install 1/2" Felt 1,250 LF $0.01 $12.50 $1.55 $1,937.50 $3.00 $3,750.00
20 Furnish Linseed QOil Cure 115 GAL $0.01 $1.15 $10.00 $1,150.00 $13.00 $1,495.00
21 Furnish & Place Detectable Warning Fields (24" x 24" Cast DWD Yellow) 48 EA $27.50 $1,320.00 $150.00 $7,200.00 $150.00 $7,200.00
22 Furnish Traffic Control 1 LS $20,140.00 $20,140.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $12,338.00 $12,338.00
23 Furnish 8" Top Soil & Sod 5,400 SF $1.75 $9,450.00 $1.85 $9,990.00 $2.00 $10,800.00
24 Furnish Terrace Restoration 7,650 SF $1.15 $8,797.50 $1.85 $14,152.50 $1.00 $7,650.00
Subtotal (Items 1-24) $738,325.50 $821,818.75 $762,070.00
Sewer/Drainage Items
25 Furnish & Install 4" ADS Drain Tile w/ Silt Sock (includes 3/8" stone chip backfill) 4,950 LF $13.50 $66,825.00 $15.10 $74,745.00 $13.50 $66,825.00
26 Adjust Structure (6" or less) (Catchbasins) 34 EA $475.00 $16,150.00 $475.00 $16,150.00 $400.00 $13,600.00
27 Repair Structure (6" or Greater) (Includes Catchbasins, Manholes & Sanitary) 10 VF $350.00 $3,500.00 $350.00 $3,500.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00
28 Remove Abandoned Structure 3 EA $500.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $400.00 $1,200.00
29 Furnish & Install 84" Deck Slab Storm MH 6 VF $1,300.00 $7,800.00 $1,300.00 $7,800.00 $1,500.00 $9,000.00
30 Furnish & Install 60" Deck Slab Storm MH 4 VF No Bid $700.00 $2,800.00 No Bid $700.00 $2,800.00 $1,200.00 $4,800.00
31 Furnish & Install Manhole Frame & Grate (Neenah R-1661-A Frame, Lid w/ Pickhole) 2 EA $500.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $850.00 $1,700.00
32 Furnish & Install 24"x36" Storm Catchbasin 60 VF $395.00 $23,700.00 $395.00 $23,700.00 $600.00 $36,000.00
33 Furnish & Install Catch Basin Frame & Grate - Neenah R-3246 w/ Type C Grate 12 EA $500.00 $6,000.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $950.00 $11,400.00
34 Furnish & Install 12" RCP Storm Sewer Class V (w/ gravel backfill) 170 LF $115.50 $19,635.00 $115.00 $19,550.00 $105.00 $15,015.00
35 Furnish Storm Water Basin Construction 250 Sy $4.00 $1,000.00 $29.50 $7,375.00 $20.64 $5,160.00
Subtotal (Items 25-35) $149,910.00 $164,120.00 $174,700.00
Alternate 1 - Asphalt Bid Totals
1 General Items (Items 1 - 24) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $821,818.75 $762,070.00
2 Sewer/Drainage Items (Items 25-35) $0.00 $149,910.00 $0.00 $164,120.00 $174,700.00
3 Contingency $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $0.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
Base Bid Total NO BID $174,910.00 NO BID $1,010,938.75 $961,770.00
Alternate 2 Concrete
1 Furnish, Install & Maintain Inlet Protection 20 EA $15.00 $300.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $1,000.00
2 Furnish 7" Concrete Pavement Removal 4,560 SY $3.00 $13,680.00 $5.15 $23,484.00 $4.08 $18,604.80 $7.00 $31,920.00
3 Furnish Concrete Sidewalk & Driveway Removal 600 Sy $4.50 $2,700.00 $0.48 $288.00 $7.89 $4,734.00 $7.00 $4,200.00
4 Furnish Unclassified Excavation 770 CY $14.50 $11,165.00 $16.60 $12,782.00 $19.72 $15,184.40 $23.50 $18,095.00
5 Furnish Excavation Below Subgrade (EBS) 100 cY $18.00 $1,800.00 $16.52 $1,652.00 $19.72 $1,972.00 $23.50 $2,350.00




6 Furnish Sawcut 500 LF $1.35 $675.00 $1.99 $995.00 $1.50 $750.00 $1.80 $900.00
7 Furnish & Place 1-1/4" Stone Base 1,450 TON $14.40 $20,880.00 $13.33 $19,328.50 $13.41 $19,444.50 $16.00 $23,200.00
8 Furnish & Place 7" Concrete Pavement 4,560 Sy $28.00 $127,680.00 $24.08 $109,804.80 $23.82 $108,619.20 $27.75 $126,540.00
9 Furnish & Place 30" Curb & Gutter 2,650 LF $14.95 $39,617.50 $11.30 $29,945.00 $13.43 $35,589.50 $13.75 $36,437.50
10 Furnish & Place 30" Curb & Gutter - Hand Poured 175 LF $17.95 $3,141.25 $18.75 $3,281.25 $20.37 $3,564.75 $30.60 $5,355.00
11 Furnish & Place 7" Concrete Driveway Apron 480 SY $36.00 $17,280.00 $42.59 $20,443.20 $52.06 $24,988.80 $41.50 $19,920.00
12 Furnish & Place 7" Concrete Handicap Ramp 800 SF $4.75 $3,800.00 $4.71 $3,768.00 $6.07 $4,856.00 $6.10 $4,880.00 No Bid
13 Furnish & Place 5" Concrete Sidewalk 150 SF $4.65 $697.50 $4.71 $706.50 $6.07 $910.50 $6.70 $1,005.00
14 Furnish & Place 5" Concrete Sidewalk 450 SF $3.70 $1,665.00 $3.35 $1,507.50 $5.41 $2,434.50 $5.25 $2,362.50
15 Furnish Tie Bars 900 EA $5.20 $4,680.00 $1.54 $1,386.00 $4.66 $4,194.00 $5.50 $4,950.00
16 Furnish & Install 1/2" Felt 950 LF $1.00 $950.00 $0.01 $9.50 $0.40 $380.00 $1.55 $1,472.50
17 Furnish Linseed QOil Cure 25 GAL $15.18 $379.50 $0.01 $0.25 $7.75 $193.75 $10.00 $250.00
18 Furnish & Place Detectable Warning Fields (24" x 24" Cast DWD Yellow) 20 EA $123.00 $2,460.00 $26.67 $533.40 $123.00 $2,460.00 $150.00 $3,000.00
19 Furnish Traffic Control 1 LS $13,850.00 $13,850.00 $8,140.00 $8,140.00 $1,667.00 $1,667.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
20 Furnish Structure Adjustment (6" or Less) (Catch Basins) 19 EA $240.00 $4,560.00 $350.00 $6,650.00 $475.00 $9,025.00 $475.00 $9,025.00
21 Furnish Terrace Restoration 6,300 SF $1.80 $11,340.00 $1.15 $7,245.00 $1.15 $7,245.00 $1.90 $11,970.00
Subtotal (Items 1 -21) $283,300.75 $252,949.90 $267,817.70 $311,332.50
Contingency $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
Eaton/Merrill Only Total $298,300.75 $267,949.90 $282,817.70 $326,332.50
Base Bid - Final
Concrete Base Bid $959,277.65 $1,062,563.55 $1,061,414.75 $1,217,598.00 NO BID
Alternate 1 - Final
Asphalt Alternate 1 Bid NO BID $973,655.50 NO BID $1,010,938.75 $961,770.00
Extras & Deletions - Final
Concrete Base Bid - Replace 4" Drain Tile w/ 12" ADS AdvanEdge $10.00/LF $93,060.00 $104,643.00 $95,000.00 NO BID
Asphalt Base Bid - Replace 4" Drain Tile w/ 12" ADS AdvanEdge NO BID $93,060.00 NO BID $95,000.00 $108,900.00
Alternate 3 - Final
Alternate 3 - Eaton/Merrill Concrete Only Bid $283,300.75 $267,949.90 $282,817.70 $326,332.50 NO BID




